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The Logic of the Heart sets forth a case for the rationality of the Christian faith. As such, it is a unique
exercise in philosophical apologetics and an ambitious project to restore passionate reason to Christianity. To
accomplish his aim, philosopher James Peters carefully analyzes the thought of Augustine and Blaise Pascal.
Even more interesting, he employs the writings of skeptic David Hume as a backdrop to this analysis to show
the importance of harmonizing the head and the heart in matters of faith. Peters ultimately finds the balance
between the Enlightenment's overemphasis on human autonomy and reason alone and postmodernism's
espousal of the creation of reality and interpretive freedom. It is the proper use of reason--guided by the
human heart--that truly locates and embeds humans in the world and helps them to live wisely.

"With a clarity seldom achieved, Peters draws on the work of unlikely allies--Hume, Pascal, and Augustine--
in defense of the rationality of Christian convictions. Interestingly enough, it turns out our faith depends for
its reasons on the love of God. This is an important book that hopefully will be widely read."--Stanley
Hauerwas, Gilbert T. Rowe Professor of Theological Ethics, Duke University Divinity School

"Peters's Logic of the Heart is the 'missing link' in contemporary discussions of epistemology, and as such, it
stands to make a significant contribution to the literature in philosophy of religion, and religious
epistemology in particular, while also introducing students to key figures in the history of
philosophy."--James K. A. Smith, associate professor of philosophy, Calvin College; author, Who's Afraid
of Postmodernism?

"Right from the start it became instantly clear to me that The Logic of the Heart's argument is timely, unique,
and structurally ingenious. Frankly, Peters's reading of Hume from his constructive Augustinian-Pascalian
position is flat-out brilliant."--Creston Davis, assistant professor of religion, Rollins College; coeditor,
Theology and the Political
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Ables:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what yours problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They must answer that question since just
their can do that will. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is right. Because start
from on guardería until university need this particular The Logic of the Heart: Augustine, Pascal, and the
Rationality of Faith to read.

Michael Sheridan:

The particular book The Logic of the Heart: Augustine, Pascal, and the Rationality of Faith will bring one to
the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. When you try
to find new book to study, this book very ideal to you. The book The Logic of the Heart: Augustine, Pascal,
and the Rationality of Faith is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book through the
official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Dewey Rascon:

The Logic of the Heart: Augustine, Pascal, and the Rationality of Faith can be one of your beginner books
that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that
could increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless
delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to place every word into delight arrangement in
writing The Logic of the Heart: Augustine, Pascal, and the Rationality of Faith nevertheless doesn't forget
the main stage, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource facts that maybe you can
be among it. This great information may drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial thinking.

Peggy Young:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can satisfy
your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book that need more time to
be go through. The Logic of the Heart: Augustine, Pascal, and the Rationality of Faith can be your answer as
it can be read by a person who have those short free time problems.
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