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Diploma Thesis from the year 2002 in the subject English Language and Literature Studies - Culture and
Applied Geography, grade: very good, University of Salzburg (Anglistics-American Studies), 46 entries in
the bibliography, language: English, abstract: Although I have never been a regular viewer of ‘Star Trek’ and
thus would not con¬sider myself a “Trekkie”, I have chosen this quotation as a starting point as it very well
ex¬presses the problem I will deal with in the following paper: being different in terms of culture, language,
education, or social status.

I have also chosen the above quotation because of its second line as it suggests a produc¬tive way of dealing
with the difficulty of being different. Be it in a thousand years or in the present time, we have to find
solutions to the problems that arise when people coming from totally different cultural or social backgrounds
meet and have to live together.

In the course of my studies at the University of Salzburg, I have come across a broad variety of topics related
to the field of Linguistics. Among others, I dealt with the linguistic terminology at the beginning of our
studies, some varieties of English, their main features, with Psycholinguistics, or with language acquisition
but to name a few. However, one main topic of Linguistics that has always had a special attraction to me was
the field of Sociolin-guistics. It has been interesting to hear how speakers’ cultural or social background, age,
gen-der, or education, have an influence on their register. Furthermore, it is also important that language
always represents a certain status or the membership to a certain ethnic group and/or minority. Normally,
people who speak a certain dialect are proud of that and it means more to them than just speaking it. It
represents heritage, tradition, and sometimes nationalism for them. They simply want to be different in order
to dissociate themselves from other ethnic groups with different dialects.
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From reader reviews:

Adrian Kester:

The guide untitled Communication Problems in Multicultural Companies is the book that recommended to
you to see. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The language that article
author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of
exploration when write the book, therefore the information that they share for your requirements is
absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Communication Problems in Multicultural Companies
from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Jenni Roberts:

Communication Problems in Multicultural Companies can be one of your beginner books that are good idea.
Many of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can increase your
knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The article
writer giving his/her effort to get every word into delight arrangement in writing Communication Problems
in Multicultural Companies nevertheless doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest and also
based confirm resource data that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information could drawn
you into brand new stage of crucial considering.

William Devine:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its include may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
look likes. Maybe you answer is usually Communication Problems in Multicultural Companies why because
the fantastic cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint you. The inside or
content is fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this
book.

James Sweeney:

This Communication Problems in Multicultural Companies is great book for you because the content that is
full of information for you who always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This book
reveal it info accurately using great manage word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside. So if you
are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward
sentences but tough core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Communication Problems
in Multicultural Companies in your hand like getting the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous 1. We
can say that no e-book that offer you world inside ten or fifteen moment right but this book already do that.
So , this is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt in which?
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