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New from the author of Full Throttle and Jacked Up!

Switching into high gear…
 
At a friend’s lavish wedding, Harley McLain and her twin sister, Charity, meet sexy stock-car driver Cooper
Brickman. The more reserved Harley is immediately smitten—until he hits on her twin. But Harley has had
enough of being the “nice” girl, and after trading dresses with Charity, she seduces Cooper for a night of
wild sex.
 
…ready for a hot lap.
 
What was supposed to be a one-night fling gets complicated when Cooper needs a nanny to look after his kid
sister—and is convinced sweet, dependable Harley would be perfect for the job. She can’t resist the
money—or Cooper’s hot bod. But when her deception is revealed, will it destroy her dependable image—or
will he finally realize how sexy sweet can be?
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From reader reviews:

Lois Yale:

The book Final Lap (Fast Track Book 8) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. Why then must we leave a very important thing like a book Final Lap (Fast
Track Book 8)? Several of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that book can give
many details for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or
facts that you take for that, you could give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Final Lap (Fast
Track Book 8) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can
search the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Mable Garza:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
look likes. Maybe you answer is usually Final Lap (Fast Track Book 8) why because the fantastic cover that
make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as
the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Pierre Winter:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you
learn a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, simply because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on
what types of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us
novel, comics, as well as soon. The Final Lap (Fast Track Book 8) will give you a new experience in
studying a book.

Mark Adair:

That book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Final Lap (Fast Track Book 8) was multi-colored
and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Final Lap (Fast Track Book 8) has many kinds or
category. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and believe that
you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it offers you
feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading that will.
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